
Price : Rs. 5-00 (5319) 

 

Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015–2017 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Haryana Government Gazette 
EXTRAORDINARY 

Published by Authority 
© Govt.  of   Haryana  

No. 136-2016/Ext]   CHANDIGARH, FRIDAY, AUGUST  26, 2016 (BHADRA 4, 1938   SAKA) 
 

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT 

Notification 

The 26th August, 2016 

No. 27-HLA of 2016/92.— The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and 
Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 2016, is hereby published for general information under 
proviso to Rule 128 of  the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative 
Assembly :- 

Bill No. 27- HLA of  2016  

THE HARYANA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 

(SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS) 

AMENDMENT BILL, 2016 

A  

Bill  

further to amend the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members) 
Act, 1975. 

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-seventh year of the 
Republic of India as follows:- 

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and 
Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2016. 

Short title. 

2. In section 2A of the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Pension of 
Members) Act, 1975 (hereinafter called the principal Act), for the words “thirty thousand rupees”, 
the words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been 
substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016. 

Amendment of 
section 2A of 
Haryana Act 2 of 
1975. 

3. Section 3 of the principal Act shall be omited. Omission of 
section 3 of 
Haryana Act 2 of 
1975. 



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5320

Amendment of 
section 3A of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975. 

4. In section 3A of the principal Act, for the words “thirty thousand rupees”, the words “forty 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from 
the 1st April, 2016.  

Amendment of 
section 3C of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975. 

5. In section 3C of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen 
thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from 
the 1st April, 2016. 

Amendment of 
section 3D of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975. 

6. In section 3D of the principal Act, for the words “per mensem” and “the person”, the words 
“per mensem each” and “the two persons” shall be substituted respectively and shall be deemed to 
have been substituted with effect from the 1st September, 2016.  

Amendment of 
section 5 of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975. 

7. In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 5 of the principal Act, for the 
words “one thousand five hundred rupees per day”, the words “two thousand rupees per day for 
maximum 15 days in a month” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted 
with effect from the 1st September, 2016.  

Amendment of 
section 6  of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975. 

8. In sub-section (2) and (3) of section 6 of the principal Act, for the words “telephone”, the 
words “telephone and one mobile phone“ shall be substituted respectively. 

 

Amendment of 
section 7 of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975 

9. In clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 7 of the principal Act, for the words “two lac 
rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been 
substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016.  

Amendment of 
section 7A of 
Haryana Act 2 
of 1975. 

10. Clause (b) of sub-section (4) of section 7A of the principal Act shall be omitted. 

 



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5321

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

At present MLAs are being paid Salary @ Rs.30,000/- per month, Constituency Allowance @ Rs.30,000/- per 
month, Office Allowance @ Rs.10,000/- per month, Daily Allowance @ Rs.1,500/- per day, Free travelling facility 
@ Rs.2.00 lakh per year, Secretarial Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for one person and Telephone Allowance 
@ Rs.15,000/- per month for a telephone at residence under the provisions of the Haryana Legislative Assembly 
(Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1975. 

Keeping in view the rise in the cost of living, it is proposed to increase the Salary of Members of Legislative 
Assembly from Rs.30,000/- per month to Rs.40,000/- per month, Constituency Allowance @ Rs.30,000/- per month 
to Rs.40,000/- per month, Office Allowance @ Rs.10,000/- per month to Rs.15,000/- per month, Daily Allowance @ 
Rs.1,500/- per day to Rs.2,000/- per day for maximum 15 days in a month, Free travelling facility @ Rs.2.00 lakh per 
year to Rs.3.00 lakh per year, Secretarial Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for one person to Rs.15,000/- each for 
two persons and Telephone Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for a telephone at residence is being substituted to a 
telephone and a Mobile phone for residence. It is also proposed to omit the Compensatory Allowance and Section 7A 
(4) (b) of the ibid Act. 

 
 RAM BILAS SHARMA,                                                                                                     
 Parliamentary Affairs Minister, Haryana. 
 

___________ 
 

The Governor has, in pursuance of Clauses (1) and (3) of Article 207 of the Constitution of India, 
recommended to the Haryana Legislative Assembly the Introduction and consideration of the Bill. 

 
 
Chandigarh:  R.K. NANDAL, 
The 26th August,2016. Secretary.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5322

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM 

The proposed increase in Salary, Constituency Allowance, Office Allowance, Secretarial Allowance, Daily 
Allowance and Free Travel Facility of Members of  Legislative Assembly will entail an extra expenditure of 
approximately ₹3,92,28,000/- (Rupees three crore ninety two lakh twenty eight thousand only) per year from the State 
Exchequer. The withdrawal of Compensatory Allowance will save an amount of ₹54.00 lakh (Rupees fifty four lakh 
only). The amount of Daily Allowance can not be ascertained at this stage as this will depend upon the tours of 
Members.  

 



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5323

[izkf/kd`r vuqokn] 

2016 dk fo/ks;d la[;k 27-,på,yå,å 

gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL; osru] HkRrk rFkk isa’ku½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2016 
gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL; osru] HkRrk rFkk isa’ku½  

vf/kfu;e] 1975] dks vkxs la’kksf/kr  
djus ds fy,  

fo/ks;d 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds lM+lBosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g 
vf/kfu;fer gksa %&  

1- ;g vf/kfu;e gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL; osru] HkRrk rFkk isa’ku½ la’kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2016] 
dgk tk ldrk gSaA 

laf{kIr ukeA 

2- gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL; osru] HkRrk rFkk isa’ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1975 ¼ftls] blesa] blds ckn] 
ewy vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½] dh /kkjk 2d esa] “rhl gtkj #i;s” ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] “pkyhl gtkj 
#i;s”  'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs rFkk izFke vizSy] 2016 ls izfrLFkkfir fd, x, le>s tk,aaxsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 2d dk 
la’kks/kuA 

3-     ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 dk yksi dj fn;k tk,xkA  1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 3 dk yksiA 

4- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3d esa] “rhl gtkj #i;s” ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] “pkyhl gtkj #i;s” 
'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs rFkk izFke vizSy] 2016 ls izfrLFkkfir fd, x, le>s tk,aaxsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 3d dk 
la’kks/kuA 

5- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3x esa] “nl gtkj #i;s” ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] “iUnzg gtkj #i;s” 
'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs rFkk izFke vizSy] 2016 ls izfrLFkkfir fd, x, le>s tk,aaxsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 3x dk 
la’kks/kuA 

6- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3?k esa] “izfr ekl” rFkk “O;fDr” ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] ØEk’k%  
“izR;sd izfrekl” rFkk “nks O;fDr;ksa” 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs rFkk izFke flrEcj] 2016 ls 
izfrLFkkfir fd, x, le>s tk,aaxsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 3?k dk 
la’kks/kuA 

7- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 5 dh mi /kkjk ¼1½ ds [k.M ¼[k½ ds mi&[k.M ¼ii½ esa “izfrfnu ,d 
gtkj ikap lkS #i;s” ’kCnksa ds LFkku ij] “fdlh ekl esa vf/kdre iUnzg fnu ds fy, izfr fnu nks 
gtkj #i;s” 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs rFkk izFke flrEcj] 2016 ls izfrLFkkfir fd, x, le>s 
tk,aaxsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 5 dk 
la’kks/kuA 

8- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 6 dh mi&/kkjk ¼2½ rFkk ¼3½  esa] “VsyhQksu” ’kCn ds LFkku ij] Øe'k% 
“VsyhQksu rFkk ,d eksckbZy Qksu” 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 6 dk 
la’kks/kuA 

9- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 7 dh mi&/kkjk ¼1½ ds [k.M ¼d½ esa] “nks yk[k #i;s” ’kCnksa ds LFkku 
ij] “rhu yk[k #i;s” 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, tk,axs rFkk izFke vizSy] 2016 ls izfrLFkkfir fd, x, 
le>s tk,aaxsA 

1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 7 dk 
la’kks/kuA 

10- ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 7d dh mi&/kkjk ¼4½ ds [k.M ¼[k½ dk yksi dj fn;k tk,xkA  1975 dk gfj;k.kk 
vf/kfu;e 2 dh 
/kkjk 7d dk 
la'kks/kuA 



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5324

mn~ns';ksa RkFkk dkj.kksa dk fooj.k 

orZeku esa gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ds lnL;ksa dks 30]000@& #i;s izfr ekl osru] 30]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl 
fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk] 10]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl dk;kZy; HkRrk] 1]500@& #i;ss izfr fnu nSfud HkRrk] eqQ~r ;k=k lqfo/kk 
2-00 yk[k #i;ss izfr o"kZ] 15]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl ,d O;fDr ds fy, lfpoh; HkRrk ,oa 15]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl 
vkokl ij ,d VsyhQksu ds fy, VsyhQksu HkRrk] gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ¼lnL; osru] HkRrk rFkk isa’ku½ vf/kfu;e] 1975 ds 
izko/kku vuqlkj fn;k tk jgk gS A  

thouksi;ksxh oLrqvksa dh dherksa esa c<+kSrjh ds n`f"Vxr ;g izLrkfor fd;k x;k gS fd osru 30]000@& #i;ss izfr 
ekl ls c<+kdj 40]000@& #i;ss] fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk 30]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl ls c<+kdj 40]000@& #i;ss] dk;kZy; 
HkRrk 10]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl ls c<+kdj 15]000@& #i;ss] nSfud HkRrk 1]500@& #i;ss izfr fnu ls c<+kdj 2]000@& 
#i;ss vf/kdre 15 fnuksa ds fy, izfr ekg] eqQ~r ;k=k lqfo/kk 2-00 yk[k #i;ss izfr o"kZ ls c<+kdj 3-00 yk[k #i;ss izfr 
o"kZ] lfpoh; HkRrk 15]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl ,d O;fDr ds fy, ls c<+kdj 15]000@& #i;ss nks O;fDr;ksa ds fy, ,oa 
vkokl ij ,d VsyhQksu ds fy, VsyhQksu HkRrk 15]000@& #i;ss ls cnydj vkokl ij ,d VsyhQksu vkSj ,d eksckbZy 
Qksu ds fy, VsyhQksu HkRrk 15]000@& #i;ss izfr ekl dj fn;k tk,A ;g Hkh izLrkfor gS fd izfriwjd HkRrs rFkk mDr 
v/khfu;e dh /kkjk 7d dh mi /kkjk ¼4½¼[k½ dks yksi fd;k tk,A 

 jke fcykl ’kekZ] 
 lalnh; dk;Z ea=h] gfj;k.kkA 

_____________ 
 
 

Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 207 ds [k.M ¼1½ rFkk ¼3½ ds vuqlj.k esa jkT;iky us gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ls bl 
fo/ks;d dks izLrqr djus rFkk bl ij fopkj djus dh flQkfj’k dh gSA 

 

p.Mhx<+% vkjå dså ukany] 
fnukad 26 vxLr] 2016- lfpoA 



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5325

foÙkh; Kkiu 

gfj;k.kk fo/kku lHkk ds lnL;ksa ds osru] fuokZpu {ks= HkRrk] dk;kZy; HkRrk] lfpoh; HkRrk] nSfud HkRrk ,oa eq¶r 
;k=k lqfo/kk esa izLrkfor c<+kSrjh fd, tkus ds QyLo:i jktdks"k ij yxHkx  ₹3]92]28]000@& ¼rhu djksM+ ckuos yk[k 
vBkbZl gtkj #i;s½ izfr o"kZ vfrfjDr [kpkZ vk,xkA izfrdj HkRrs dh okilh ls yxHkx ₹54-00 yk[k dh cpr gksxhA bl 
Lrj ij nSfud HkRrs dh jkf’k dk vuqeku ugha yxk;k tk ldrk D;kssafd ;s lnL;ksa ds nkSjksa ij fuHkZj djsxkA 

 

 
 

54591—H.V.S.—H.G.P.,Chd. 


