Regd. No. CHD/0093/2015-2017

Harpana Gouernment Bazette

EXTRAORDINARY
Published by Authority

© Govt. of Haryana
No. 136-2016/Ext] CHANDIGARH, FRIDAY, AUGUST 26,2016 (BHADRA 4, 1938 SAKA)

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT
Notification
The 26th August, 2016
No. 27-HLA of 2016/92.— The Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and
Pension of Members) Amendment Bill, 2016, is hereby published for general information under
proviso to Rule 128 of the Rules of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative
Assembly :-
Bill No. 27- HLA of 2016
THE HARYANA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
(SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION OF MEMBERS)
AMENDMENT BILL, 2016
A
Bill
further to amend the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members)
Act, 1975.
BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Sixty-seventh year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

1. This Act may be called the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Shorttitle.
Pension of Members) Amendment Act, 2016.

2. In section 2A of the Haryana Legislative Assembly (Salary, Allowances and Pension of =~ Amendment of
Members) Act, 1975 (hereinafter called the principal Act), for the words “thirty thousand rupees”, i?:“‘;‘:;’:gg of
the words “forty thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been 19?51_
substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016.

3. Section 3 of the principal Act shall be omited. Omission of
section 3 of

Haryana Act 2 of
1975.

Price : Rs. 5-00 (5319)



5320

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA)

Amendment of
section 3A of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 3C of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 3D of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 5 of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 6 of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

Amendment of
section 7 of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975

Amendment of
section 7A of
Haryana Act 2
of 1975.

4. In section 3A of the principal Act, for the words “thirty thousand rupees”, the words “forty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from
the 1st April, 2016.

5. In section 3C of the principal Act, for the words “ten thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from
the 1st April, 2016.

6. In section 3D of the principal Act, for the words “per mensem” and “the person”, the words
“per mensem each” and “the two persons” shall be substituted respectively and shall be deemed to
have been substituted with effect from the 1st September, 2016.

7. In sub-clause (ii) of clause (b) of sub-section (1) of section 5 of the principal Act, for the
words “one thousand five hundred rupees per day”, the words “two thousand rupees per day for
maximum 15 days in a month” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted
with effect from the 1st September, 2016.

8. In sub-section (2) and (3) of section 6 of the principal Act, for the words “telephone”, the
words “telephone and one mobile phone* shall be substituted respectively.

9. In clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 7 of the principal Act, for the words “two lac
rupees”, the words “three lakh rupees” shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 1st April, 2016.

10.  Clause (b) of sub-section (4) of section 7A of the principal Act shall be omitted.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5321

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

At present MLAs are being paid Salary @ Rs.30,000/- per month, Constituency Allowance @ Rs.30,000/- per
month, Office Allowance @ Rs.10,000/- per month, Daily Allowance @ Rs.1,500/- per day, Free travelling facility
@ Rs.2.00 lakh per year, Secretarial Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for one person and Telephone Allowance
@ Rs.15,000/- per month for a telephone at residence under the provisions of the Haryana Legislative Assembly
(Salary, Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1975.

Keeping in view the rise in the cost of living, it is proposed to increase the Salary of Members of Legislative
Assembly from Rs.30,000/- per month to Rs.40,000/- per month, Constituency Allowance @ Rs.30,000/- per month
to Rs.40,000/- per month, Office Allowance @ Rs.10,000/- per month to Rs.15,000/- per month, Daily Allowance @
Rs.1,500/- per day to Rs.2,000/- per day for maximum 15 days in a month, Free travelling facility @ Rs.2.00 lakh per
year to Rs.3.00 lakh per year, Secretarial Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for one person to Rs.15,000/- each for
two persons and Telephone Allowance @ Rs.15,000/- per month for a telephone at residence is being substituted to a
telephone and a Mobile phone for residence. It is also proposed to omit the Compensatory Allowance and Section 7A
(4) (b) of the ibid Act.

RAM BILAS SHARMA,
Parliamentary Affairs Minister, Haryana.

The Governor has, in pursuance of Clauses (1) and (3) of Article 207 of the Constitution of India,
recommended to the Haryana Legislative Assembly the Introduction and consideration of the Bill.

Chandigarh: R.K. NANDAL,
The 26th August,2016. Secretary.



5322 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA)

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

The proposed increase in Salary, Constituency Allowance, Office Allowance, Secretarial Allowance, Daily
Allowance and Free Travel Facility of Members of Legislative Assembly will entail an extra expenditure of
approximately %3,92,28,000/- (Rupees three crore ninety two lakh twenty eight thousand only) per year from the State
Exchequer. The withdrawal of Compensatory Allowance will save an amount of ¥54.00 lakh (Rupees fifty four lakh

only). The amount of Daily Allowance can not be ascertained at this stage as this will depend upon the tours of
Members.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5323
[T STgaTe]
2016 &1 fag® W1 27-TdoTcloVo
g faams |91 (ASw ddq, |l a1 4eE) Sweq fagas, 2016
gRITOT fagmE guT (WS 99+, "« a1 9YF)
arferferr, 1975, @Y M Genfera
& D oy
faga®
YRT TTRST & Feded ay § sRImm sy faum+vesa grr f=falRed s & I8
rffrafad 8 —
1. g fRaf e sRarm fAum @ (e dad, 9ol 9 UIF) Gened ifSfgH, 2016, Wi ||
BT ST A 2 |
2. RN faue 9T (A 9o, Ao JoO UeH) ifafrm, 1975 (R, $9H, 39@ 9Tg, 1975 @1 gRamon
Tl SR BEr AT R), B ART 2% ¥, <d B W Ul b W W, Al goR e 2 B
SIR” vTee ufenfid Py S dem oM oiid, 2016 W UfReNfid Py 7T AHSI TG | mw
3. I IR @ ORT 3 & A" wR A Srgr | 1975$r€ﬁ?ﬁjﬂﬂ
ffray 2
€T 3 BT A |
4. WA ARAFE @ g 3% H, N FOR TW” URT D R W, “AAN IR SYI” 1975 BT sRam
vreg gfoRenfid fhy SITGRT qem yerd ke, 2016 & wfoRenfud fhy Ty awsr SIo | m;aﬁ
e |
5 Ho JRFEH @1 GR1 3T H, < §OR YU ARl b WM W, “UEE R VUY” 1975 BT SRATW
v gfeRenfia Py G qerm oM aiier, 2016 W UfeReNd fhy U T#er e | mg{aﬁ
e |
6. T ARfH @1 g1 3w H cufd WA dn cafed” weel & wid WR, B 1975 @1 sRamm
e URMERT g1 “q) ARTET e URRenid fhy GG derm uew RiqwR, 2016 § SO 2 @
gforenfid fbu 17 Ty ST | ‘T.R? mlm
7. I JIREH @ 9T 5 @ [U ORI (1) & Wre (@) & Iu-@vs (i) § “ufdfed um 1975 @1 sRamm
TR U W S Wl @ e W, “Reell A § eifdedw usw T @ fog ufy e ey SRR 2 @
TR S Treg yfoRenfid fby Sewr @on yem Riawx, 2016 & uforenfud ey v sy er_mhslm
S |
8.  Hd JAfAFTE &1 gRT 6 B SU—GRT (2) T (3) H, “CllBIT” ed & A W, HH: 1975 BT SRAM
SN T Y ATEel BT Weq TR by W | S 2 91
e |
9. A JARFREH P gRT 7 B SU—GRT (1) S WUS ($) H, “a I SUY” Teal & WIF 1975 3T gRawn
W, A g TR e ufRenfid fry STET qer verm onidl, 2016 ¥ ufoRenfyq fpy wg SRR 2 @
NEERSIEE W7Tf
10. o IRNTH & ORT 76 B IT-GRT (4) & WUS (@) B AM R AT S| 1975@73@%@
arfSfrae 2

gYRT 7 BT
e |



5324 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA)

IRl aAT HRONT HT faawor

gaa H BRI AU | & \@ewdl @ 30,000 /— BUF YT AT dd, 30,000 /— U Uiy AN
A & 9, 10,000/ — U Ul A BRI A, 1,500 /— F9 U faq e wiean, gia = giaen
200 dRg B9 Ui 99, 15,000 /— ¥R UT 9T TP Afdd b v Ffada v vd 15,000 /— B9 Ui AN
AR R UH Al & g Selldla wedn, ERATOT e 99T (I dad, ol a1 UeF) srfaf s, 1975 &
Ul AR QT ST RET & |

SHEAANT a3l BT Bl ¥ gelad] & giedd I8 ywariad fbar Tar € & da= 30,000 /— d9d Ufa
A W 9eTdhR 40,000 /— B9, fafee & Wl 30,000 /— BUA URT AR W 9@THR 40,000 /— S, BRI
AT 10,000 /— U Ui AT A GGTBR 15,000 / — BT, &I Wl 1,500 /— B9 Ui fad | 9@ 2,000 / —
JR Af¥Had 15 faA1 & fory ufcr |18, g AT Giaar 2.00 RT JUY Ui 99 A FE[HR 3.00 I BUY Gfel
¥, Afad A 15,000 /— B9 UfY AT U Afdd & fIT F 9@ 15,000 /— $UY &1 Afdadl & fow ud
M TR UH <ellbid & folg TeflhI| T 15,000 /— BT | GBI TR Udh Sollh AR Th Aldgd
B & folg THBE 9 15,000 /— U URT A &R A1 <MY | I8 0 garfad & fb ufiqres W dem Sa
JNFTIH B aRT 786 B ST ORI (4)(F) B A9 foar g |

M e o,
A<y drd w4, gRarom |

IRA & e & ees 207 & @US (1) TAT (3) & IRV H I5JUTA - SRAOM = w91 4 59
fORrs &1 URgd &3 a0 89 R IR a7 3 Ry & 2|

aﬂé Te: 3No Eﬁo H'aa,
feHT® 26 IRA, 2016. e |



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), AUG. 26, 2016 (BHDR. 4, 1938 SAKA) 5325

fa<fa smu=

BRI g ¥ & Wel & daq, FarEd & 9, $ted v, dred W, Qe v g gu
I G § YA 9Nl By S & By ISIdI¥ IR ST 33,92,28,000 / — (9 RIe aMd o
oS BOIR BUd) Uit a¥ ifaRad @@t My | Uit 9l @7 aroRil | T 254.00 IR &I g9d 81T | S
TR R P A DT AR BT AFAM T ST ST Febal Flfh I FERAl & Rl W R T |

54591—H.V.S—H.G.P.,Chd.



